
My Elder Sister 

 

I come of a very respectable family. My father is simply a clerk in an firm. We are 
two brothers and two sisters. The eldest of us all is my sister Mohini. She is doing 
her M.B.B.S. This is her final year. Since her early age, she has been burning with 
a keen desire to become a doctor. It is rightly said, where there is a will there is a 
way. By her tireless and constant labor, she has almost achieved her goal to serve 
the ailing people. 

It is all due to her own efforts that she is going to be a doctor. My father can hardly 
bear her expenses. She earns and learns. She coaches some students and gets 
about two hundred rupees a month. She does not only support herself, but also 
helps me in my studies. I have great regard and love for her. 

She is very simple and of a lovable nature. Every member of the family has great 
affection for her. She has a very charming personality. She wins all by her set 
words and god manners. In the college she is loved and admired both by her class 
mates and professors. She is quite agreeable and polite. She performs her duties 
sincerely. 

She is an early riser. She gets up at 4:30 a.m. She helps mother in her kitchen 
work. She prepares breakfast and tea for us. She leaves for her college at 9 
O’clock. After college she comes home direct without wasting a minute in idle talks 
and wandering about. She goes to coach two students in the evening. Just after 
the dinner she starts to work and remain busy with her work till late at night. Her 
life is regular and punctual. I have never seen her becoming a victim of any 
disease. On Sundays, the does relax but also help mother in washing, sewing and 
knitting work. In a word she is quite efficient in every household duty. 

She is very kind and generous. She helps her weak classmates in studies. She 
spares no pains in serving the suffering and the sick in our neighborhood. She 
aims at serving humanity. I always pray to the Almighty god for her success and 
health. 

 


